
TP populates & signs Interconnection 
Study Agreement & tenders to IC.

IC submits Interconnection Request to 
TP with application fee, study deposit, 
site control & commercial readiness 

deposit, as required.

TP & IC hold Scoping Meeting.

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
Facilities Study Report.

(Current 1/1/2024)

Generator Interconnection Overview

TP acknowledge receipt of request & 
updates OASIS queue.

TP schedules Scoping Meeting & posts 
notice of Scoping Meeting for internal 

projects on OASIS.

TP completes Interconnection Study & 
provides IC with report.

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
interconnection study.

TP completes additional 
interconnection study

& provides IC with report.

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
additional study.

IC executes & returns final Facilities 
Study Agreement with data & deposit, 

as required.

IC provides written comments to be 
incorporated into the final report.

TP completes Facilities Study
& provides IC with draft report.

IC executes & returns executed GIA, 
site control, LGIA deposit, insurance & 

evidence of milestone activity.

TP provides final LGIA & appendices 
for execution.

Interconnection activities commence 
per the GIA.

Process Flow

Process End

Phase Start

LEGEND

IC executes & returns agreement for 
additional required interconnection 
study (SIS or cluster restudy) with 

deposit & technical data, as requried.

TP provides IC with final Facilities 
Study Report. 

IC executes & returns Interconnection  
Study Agreement; no deposit 

necessary.

TP tenders draft GIA & appendices 
to IC.

IC completes & returns draft 
appendices acknowledging appendices 

are final.



Starting Point

Stopping Point

Business DaysBD

Calendar DaysCD

Process Flow

(OR) process Flow

OR 10 BD 
(if filing unexecuted )

30 CD 

IC provides certificate of insurance.

IC provides site control, LGIP 11.3 
evidence of development & 20% LGIA 

deposit 

& 10 BD 

OR beyond timelines

TFS study start. Withdrawals after this 
date subject to withdrawal penalty.

March 2, 2024

OR 5 BD 
& by March 1

OR after 
March 1 

IC submits executed TFSA to TP w/
deposit of 100% estimated cost in 

recent SISR & exclusive site control.

5 BD 
& no later than March 4

IC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
draft TFSR.

10 BD

150 CD from January 1

(Effective 1/1/2024)

Standard Large Generator Interconnection Procedures (LGIP) 
Transitional Serial Facilities Study (TFS)*

By March 1 

TP & IC negotiate LGIA Appendices.

& 30 CD

TP notice to IC: Notice of deficiency & 
reasons for deficiency.

TP sends IC acknowledgement of 
receipt & updates OASIS queue.

TP completes draft TFS & provides IC 
with report (TFSR).

May 30, 2024

IC provides written comments to be 
incorporated into the final TFSR.

Application withdrawn w/o cure period 
& w/o penalty.

Interconnection activities can 
commence per the LGIA.

LEGEND

Application deemed withdrawn 
w/ penalty.

TP sends notice of TFS start or 
withdrawal notice to eligible ICs, as 

appropriate.  

TP provides IC with final TFSR. 15 BD 
IC notifies TP that it will not provide 

written comments.
Promptly

OR 30 CD 

IC executes & returns LGIA, site 
control, LGIP 11.3 evidence of 

development & 20% LGIA deposit or 
requests the TP file the LGIA 

unexecuted at FERC.

30 CD 

OR 60 CD 
TP tenders draft LGIA & appendices to 

IC.

& 60 CD

TP files the LGIA unexecuted at FERC.Upon FERC filing 

* Section 5.1.1/5.1.1.1: Projects with an assigned queue position that were offered a Facilities Study Agreement prior to November 1, 2023 are eligible for this process.

January 1–March 1, 2024

March 4, 2024

IC requests delay in LGIA execution 
pending completed Affected System 

Study Report.

IC receives Affected System Study 
Report or TP provides IC notice of 
material impact from further delay.

& 30 CD

OR 30 CD 

10 BD

OR beyond timelines



Starting Point

Stopping Point

Business DaysBD

Calendar DaysCD

Process Flow

(OR) process Flow

OR 10 BD 
(if filing unexecuted )

30 CD 

IC provides certificate of insurance.

IC provides site control, LGIP 11.3 
evidence of development, certificate of 

insurance & 20% LGIA deposit 

& 10 BD OR >10 BD

IC provides comments on Interim 
TCSR.

TP completes draft final TCS & 
provides IC with report (draft final 

TCSR).

30 CD

360 CD from January 1

December 26, 2024

TCS study start. Withdrawals after this 
date subject to withdrawal penalty.

March 2, 2024

LGIA in Breach.

OR 5 BD 
& by March 1

OR after 
March 1 

IC submits executed TCSA to TP w/
deposit of $5M, selection of ERIS or 

NRIS & exclusive site control.

5 BD 
& no later than March 4

IC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
draft final TCSR.

10 BD

200 CD from January 1

(Effective 1/1/2024)

Standard Large Generator Interconnection Procedures (LGIP) 
Transitional Cluster Study (TCS)*

By March 1 

TP & IC negotiate LGIA Appendices.

& 30 CD

TP notice to IC: Notice of deficiency & 
reasons for deficiency.

TP sends IC acknowledgement of 
receipt & updates OASIS queue.

TP completes interim TCS & provides 
IC with report (Interim TCSR).

July 19, 2024

IC provides written comments on the 
draft final TCSR.

Application withdrawn w/o cure period 
& w/o penalty.

Interconnection activities can 
commence per the LGIA.

LEGEND

Application deemed withdrawn 
w/ penalty.

TP sends notice of TCS start or 
withdrawal notice to eligible ICs, as 

appropriate.  

TP provides IC with final TCSR. 15 BD 
IC notifies TP that it will not provide 

written comments.
Promptly

OR 30 CD 

IC executes & returns LGIA, site 
control, LGIP 11.3 evidence of 

development & 20% LGIA deposit or 
requests the TP file the LGIA 

unexecuted at FERC.

30 CD 

OR 60 CD 
TP tenders draft LGIA & appendices to 

IC.

& 60 CD

TP files the LGIA unexecuted at FERC.Upon FERC filing 

* Section 5.1.1/5.1.1.2: Projects with an assigned queue position prior to November 1, 2023 are eligible for this process.

January 1–March 1, 2024

March 4, 2024

IC requests delay in LGIA execution 
pending completed Affected System 

Study Report.

IC receives Affected System Study 
Report or TP provides IC notice of 
material impact from further delay.

& 30 CD

OR 30 CD 

10 BD

OR beyond timelines



Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

OR 10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

OR >10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

IC submits Interconnection Request to 
TP w/$1,000 refundable deposit & 

reasonable site control
10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

10 BD (SGIP 3.2.1)

YES
5 BD (SGIP 3.2.2)

15 BD (SGIP 3.2.3)

IC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
draft FSR.

10 BD (FSA 10.0)

30/45 BD (FSA 7.0)

30 BD (SGIP 3.5.2)
15 BD (Div82-60 8c)

OR >30 BD (SGIP 3.5.2)

OR >15 BD (SGIP 3.2.2)

(IPC OATT 1/5/2022)

Standard Small Generator Interconnection Procedures (SGIP)*

10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

30 CD (FSA 9.0)

TP notice to IC: If the application failed 
& reasons it failed.

(SGIP 1.3)TP notice to IC: Acknowledge receipt of 
request & send blank Feasibility Study 
Agreement (FeSA). TP updates OASIS 

queue.

(SGIP 1.3)

TP & IC hold Scoping Meeting unless 
both parties agree to omit it. TP posts 
notice of Scoping Meeting for internal 

projects on OASIS.

(SGIP 3.2.1, 3.2.3, 
LGIP 3.5.1)

TP populates & signs Interconnection 
FeSA & tenders to IC.

(SGIP 3.2.2)

IC executes & returns FSA with 
deposit.

IC provides written comments to be 
incorporated into the final report.

TP completes FS
& provides IC with draft report (FSR).

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(LGIP 3.7)

(SGIP 1.3)

IC executes & returns the GIA.

(SGIP 4.8)

Interconnection activities can 
commence per the SGIA.

Process Flow

(OR) process Flow

Stopping Point

Starting Point

Calendar Days

Business Days

CD
BD

LEGEND

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(LGIP 3.7)

(LGIP 3.7)

TP provides IC with final FSR. 15 BD (FSA 9.0) 5 BD (SGIP 3.5.7)

30 BD (SGIP 4.8) or 15 BD (Div82-25 7(a)(A))

TP tenders executable GIA to IC.

IC requests the TP file the GIA 
unexecuted at FERC.

OR 30 BD (SGIP 4.8)

(SGIP 4.8)

TP files the GIA unexecuted at FERC.

10 BD (LGIP 11.3)

(SGIP 4.8)

(LGIP 11.3)

Upon Submission (LGIP 11.4)

OR >30 BD (SGIP 4.8)
OR >15 BD (Div82-25 7(a)(A))

Is Feasibility Study 
required?

IC executes & returns FeSA; no 
additional deposit required.

TP completes FeS, provides study 
report (FeSR) & agreement for next 

required study.

30 BD (FeSA 10.0)

TP tenders populated Interconnection 
System Impact Study Agreement 

(SISA) to IC.

IC executes & returns SISA with 
$2,000 or $10,000 deposit & technical 

data.

Is System Impact 
Study required?

(SGIP 3.2.2)
(SGIP 3.3.4, 3.3.5)

YES
30 BD (SGIP 3.4.6)

15 BD (Div82-60 7c)

NO—5 BD (SGIP 3.2.2)

30 BD (SGIP 3.4)

TP completes SIS, provides study 
report (SISR) & Facilities Study 

Agreement (FSA).

30/45 BD (SISA 9.0)

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

OR >30 BD (SGIP 3.4.6)

(LGIP 3.7) (SGIP 3.5.1)

Are additional 
facilities required?

NO

YES
30 BD (SGIP 3.5.2)

15 BD (Div82-60 8c)

(FSA 7.0)

(FSA 10.0)

(FSA 9.0) (FSA 9.0)

NO
5 BD (SGIP 3.3.4)

(LGIP 3.7)

(SGIP 3.3.4, 3.5.7)

* This process covers the following project types: Idaho PURPA up to 30 MW, Idaho non-PURPA up to 20 MW (ERIS only), Schedule 68 3–20 MW, Oregon Small PURPA Tier 4 (Div82), 
  and Oregon PURPA 11–20 MW.



OR 10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

OR >10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

IC submits Interconnection Request to 
TP w/$500 refundable deposit & 

reasonable site control
10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

15 BD (SGIP 2.2)

YES
5 BD (SGIP 2.2.2)

IC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

(IPC OATT 1/5/2022)

Fast Track Small Generator Interconnection Procedures (SGIP)*

10 BD (SGIP 1.3)

TP notice to IC: If the application failed 
& reasons it failed.

(SGIP 1.3)TP notice to IC: Acknowledge receipt 
of request & send blank Feasibility 

Study Agreement (FeSA). TP updates 
OASIS queue.

(SGIP 1.3)

Perform initial review and provide IC 
results.

(SGIP 2.2)

TP tenders executable GIA to the IC.

(SGIP 2.2.2 or 
2.2.3)

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(LGIP 3.7)

(SGIP 1.3)

Process Flow

(OR) process Flow

Stopping Point

Starting Point

Calendar Days

Business Days

CD
BD

LEGEND

Did the IR pass? IC executes & returns the GIA.30 BD (SGIP 4.8)

Can IR be 
interconnected per 

SGIP 2.2.3?

(SGIP 4.8)

TP notifies IC of failure (5 BD) & offers 
Customer Options Meeting 

(10 BD).

(SGIP 2.3)

* This process covers the following project types: Fast Track applications up to 2 MW synchronous and induction machines and up to 5 MW inverter-based systems.

Interconnection activities can 
commence per the SGIA.

(SGIP 4.8)

YES
5 BD (SGIP 2.2.3)

NO
5&10 BD (SGIP 2.3)

Can IR be 
interconnected per 

SGIP 2.3.1?

At time of failure notification
OR

At Customer Options Meeting

YES
10 BD (SGIP 2.3.1)

TP obtains IC agreement to continue 
evaluating IR through Study Process.

NO

Evaluate through SGIP beginning at 
step determined by Planning or Project 

Management department. 
TP offers to perform Supplemental 

Review & provide estimate of costs.

NO

IC provides written agreement to 
Supplemental Review and deposit.

15 BD (SGIP 2.4.1)

OR >15 BD (SGIP 2.4.1)TP completes Supplemental Review
& provides IC with results.

30 BD (SGIP 2.4.4)

YES
10 BD (SGIP 2.4.5.1)

TP tenders executable GIA to the IC.

(SGIP 2.4.5.1 
or 2.4.5.2)

Did the IR pass? IC executes & returns the GIA.30 BD (SGIP 4.8)

Can IR be 
interconnected per 

SGIP 2.4.5.2?

(SGIP 4.8)

Interconnection activities can 
commence per the SGIA.

(SGIP 4.8)

YES
15 BD (SGIP 2.4.5.2)

Evaluate through SGIP beginning at 
step determined by Planning or Project 

Management department. 

NO



TP populates & signs Interconnection 
FeSA (Appendix 2) & tenders to IC.

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

OR 5 BD (3.4.3)

OR >10 BD (3.4.3)

IC submits Interconnection Request 
(Appendix 1) to TP w/$10,000 

refundable deposit & reasonable site 
control

5 BD (3.4.2)

10 BD (3.4.4)

& 30 CD (3.4.4)

5 BD (6.1) 5 BD (6.1)

IC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

TP & IC hold Scoping Meeting.

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
draft FSR (if restudy is required, 

complete in 60 CD).

IC executes & returns Interconnection 
FeSA; no FeS deposit necessary.

10 BD (8.4)

90–180 CD (8.3) OR >30 CD (8.1)

30 CD (8.1)10 BD (7.5)

90 CD (7.4)

30 CD (7.2)

OR >30 CD (7.2)

10 BD (6.3.1)

45 CD (6.3)

OR >30 CD (6.1)

30 CD (6.1)

(IPC OATT 1/1/2024)

PURPA Large Generator Interconnection Procedures (LGIP)*

Mutual agreement to forego FeS; TP 
offers populated, unexecuted SISA to 

IC; no SISA deposit is necessary.
OR 5 BD (6.1)

30 CD (7.2)

10 BD (3.4.3)

TP & IC negotiate LGIA Appendices.

(11.2)

& 30 CD (8.3/11.1)

TP notice to IC: If the application failed 
& reasons it failed.

(3.4.3)TP notice to IC: Acknowledge receipt of 
request & send blank Feasibility Study 
Agreement (FeSA). TP updates OASIS 

queue.

(3.4.2/3.5.1)

TP schedule the Scoping Meeting. TP 
posts notice of Scoping Meeting for 

internal projects on OASIS.

(3.4.4, 3.5.1)

IC provides the point(s) of 
interconnection to TP, if different from 

application.

(6.1)

TP completes Interconnection FeS & 
provides IC with report (FeSR) & 

populated, unexecuted System Impact 
Study Agreement (SISA; Appendix 3).

(6.3/7.1)

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
interconnection FeSR (if restudy is 

required, complete in 45 CD).

(6.3.1, 6.4)

TP completes SIS
& provides IC with report (SISR) and 

populated, unexecuted Facilities Study 
Agreement (FSA; Appendix 4).

(7.4/8.1)

TP & IC hold results meeting to discuss 
SISR (if restudy is required, complete 

in 60 CD).

(7.5/7.6)

IC executes & returns FSA with 
deposit.

IC provides written comments to be 
incorporated into the final FSR.

(8.4, 8.5)

TP completes FS
& provides IC with draft report (FSR).

(8.3)

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(3.7)

(3.4.1)

(3.4.4)

(6.1)

IC executes & returns two hard copies 
of the LGIA, site control or deposit, 
insurance & evidence of milestone 

activity.

TP provides final LGIA & appendices 
for execution.

(11.3)

(6.1)

(11.2)

Interconnection activities can 
commence per the LGIA.

Process Flow

(OR) process Flow

Stopping Point

Starting Point

Calendar Days

Business Days

CD
BD

LEGEND

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(3.7)

IC executes & returns SISA with 
$50,000 deposit, site control & 

technical data.

TP notice to IC: Acknowledge receipt 
of SISA & sufficient data.

TP notice to IC: If the provided 
technical data is insufficient.

5 BD (7.2)

OR 5 BD (7.2)

IC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

OR >10 BD (7.2)

10 BD (7.2)

(3.7)

(3.7)

TP provides IC with final FSR. 15 BD (8.3)
IC notifies TP that it will not provide 

written comments.
Promptly (8.3)

OR 30 CD (8.3)

(8.3/11.1) (8.3)

& 30 CD (8.3/11.1)

IC completes & returns draft 
appendices acknowledging appendices 

are final.
30 CD (11.1)

(11.1)

OR 60 CD (11.2)

TP tenders draft LGIA & appendices to 
IC.

(11.1)

15 BD (11.2) 15 BD (11.2)

IC requests the TP file the LGIA 
unexecuted at FERC.

OR 15 BD (11.3)

(11.4)

15 BD (11.3)

TP files the LGIA unexecuted at FERC.

10 BD (11.3)

(11.3)

(11.3)

Upon Submission (11.4)

OR >15 BD (11.3)

(3.7)

* This process covers the following project types: Idaho PURPA 31–80 MW and Oregon QF-LGIP.



OR 10 BD (Div82-25 7(a)(A))

OR >10 BD (Div82-25 7(a)(A))

IC submits Interconnection Request to 
TP w/$500 or $1,000 refundable 
deposit & reasonable site control.

10 BD (Div82-25 7(a))

10 BD (Div82-50 3(a))

YES
20 BD (Div82-50 3(b))

IC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

(IPC OATT 1/5/2022)

Oregon Small PURPA Interconnection Procedures (OAR 860-082)*

10 BD (Div82-25 7(a)(A))

TP notice to IC: If the application failed 
& reasons it failed.

(Div82-25 7(a)(A))TP notice to IC: Acknowledge receipt 
of request & send blank Feasibility 

Study Agreement (FeSA). TP updates 
OASIS queue.

(Div82-25 7(a))

TP & IC hold Scoping Meeting unless 
both parties agree to omit it. TP posts 
notice of Scoping Meeting for internal 

projects on OASIS.

(Div82-50 3(a), 
-55 3(a), -60 5, 

LGIP 3.5.1)

TP evaluates the application using the  
appropriate Tier approval criteria.

(Div82-50 3(b)(A),
Div82-55 3(b)(A))

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(Div82-25 7(a)(A))

(Div82-25 1(a)/5)

Is this a Tier 2 
request?

Is the application 
approved?

Is this a Tier 3 
request?

NO

YES
20 BD (Div82-55 3(b))

NO 
15 BD 

(Div82-25 3(c))

TP tenders executable GIA to the IC.

YES
5 BD (Div82-25 7(e))

(Div82-25 7(e))

IC submits new application at next Tier. 
No additional deposit; no loss of queue 
position. Return to beginning of flow.

(Div82-25 3(c))

Application deemed withdrawn and 
queue position lost if timeline not met.

OR >15 BD (Div82-25 7(a)(A))

IC executes & returns GIA.

15 BD (Div82-25 7(e))

OR >15 BD (Div82-25 7(a)(A))

Interconnection activities can 
commence per the LGIA.

Process Flow

(OR) process Flow

Stopping Point

Starting Point

Calendar Days

Business Days

CD
BD

LEGEND

* This process covers the following project types: Oregon small PURPA 2 MW or less (Tier 2) and 10 MW or less (Tiers 3 & 4).

Process Tier 4 requests through SGIP 
with Transmission timelines beginning 

at Feasibility Study decision. 

Important Note: 
All study deposits for Tier 4 are capped 

at $1,000 (Div82-35 1). 

(Div82-60 6–8)

TP evaluates the application using the  
Tier 4 approval criteria.

(Div82-60 5(c))

Is the application 
approved?

NO

YES
5 BD (Div82-25 7(e))

(Div82-25 3(c))

NO
15 BD (Div82-60 5(c))



TP provides SIC with populated, 
unexecuted SI System Impact Study 

Agreement (SISA).

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

OR 5 BD (3.4.3)

OR >15 BD (3.3.2 d)

SIC submits Interconnection Request 
(Appendix 1) to TP w/$10,000 

refundable deposit & info required in 
section 3.3.2.

5 BD (3.4.2)

10 BD (3.3.3)

& 30 CD (3.3.3)

5 BD (3.3.4)

SIC provides additional requested 
information to TP.

TP, SIC & existing IC (if different from 
SIC) hold Scoping Meeting and 
determine if SIS is necessary.

TP, SIC & existing IC (if different from 
SIC) hold results meeting to discuss 

FSR.

IC executes & returns SI SISA  with 
$50,000 deposit.

10 BD (3.3.5.4)

90 CD (3.3.5.3)

30 CD (3.3.5.2)10 BD (3.3.4.3)

90 CD (3.3.4.2)

OR >30 CD (3.3.5.2)

OR >30 CD (3.3.4.1)

30 CD (3.3.4.1)

(IPC OATT 1/5/2022)

Surplus Interconnection Service* 
Large Generator Interconnection Procedures (LGIP)

Mutual agreement to forego SIS; TP 
offers populated, unexecuted SI 

Facilities Study Agreement (FSA) to 
SIC.

OR 5 BD (6.1)

30 CD (3.3.5.1)

15 BD (3.3.2 d)

TP & IC negotiate draft Amended GIA.

(3.3.6.2)

TP notice to SIC: If the application 
failed & reasons it failed.

(3.4.3)

TP notice to SIC: Acknowledge receipt 
of request.

(3.4.2/3.5.1)

TP schedule the Scoping Meeting. TP 
posts notice of Scoping Meeting for 

internal projects on OASIS.

(3.3.3, 3.5.1)

TP completes SI SIS
& provides SIC with report (SISR) and 

populated, unexecuted SI Facilities 
Study Agreement (FSA).

TP, SIC & existing IC (if different from 
SIC) hold results meeting to discuss SI 

SISR.

(3.3.4.2
3.3.5.1)

SIC executes & returns SI FSA with 
$50,000 deposit.

(3.3.5.4)

TP completes FS
& provides SIC with draft report (FSR).

(3.3.5.3)

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(3.7)

(3.3.2)

(3.3.3)

Existing & SIC execute final Amended 
GIA.

TP provides final Amended GIA to 
Existing & SIC for execution.

(3.3.4)

(3.3.6.2)

Agreed-upon terms can commence 
per the Amended GIA.

Process Flow

(OR) process Flow

Stopping Point

Starting Point

Calendar Days

Business Days

CD
BD

LEGEND

Application deemed withdrawn if 
timeline not met.

(3.7)

& 45 CD (3.3.6.1)

Existing & SIC provide comments on 
Amended GIA.

30 CD (3.3.6.1)

(3.3.6.1)

OR 60 CD (3.3.6.2)

TP tenders draft Amended GIA to SIC 
& existing IC (if different from SIC).

(3.3.6.1)

15 BD (3.3.6.2)

15 BD (3.3.6.2)
Existing &/or SIC requests the TP file 

the Amended GIA unexecuted at 
FERC.

OR 15 BD (3.3.6.2)

(3.3.6.3)

15 BD (11.3)

TP files the Amended GIA at FERC.

15 BD (3.3.6.3)

(3.3.6.2)

(3.3.6.3)

OR >30 CD (3.3.6.2)

(3.7)

(3.3.4.3)

Upon Submission 
(3.3.6.3)

* These requests are processed outside the GI queue.

(3.7)
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